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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  

FOR: Purchase of Various Types of Trucks

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 20, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

6 ea. *

25,000 GVWR cab-chassis, 4-door, crew-cab, 84" CA truck with installed aluminum utility UNIT PRICE 124,421.00 125,055.97 133,724.00     

body and 2,000 pound crane, complete TOTAL 746,526.00 750,335.82 802,344.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Manufacturer Make and Model MAKE/MODEL

2017 Ford F750 

25,999 GVWR  

2018 Freightliner M2

106 crew cab with 

Warner     

A. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 150-180 days 120 days     

5 ea.  *  

50,000 GVWR cab and chassis (single cab) with installed 10-cubic yard minimum (water level) UNIT PRICE 103,603.00 94,633.48 104,510.00 107,555.00    

dump body, complete, per specifications TOTAL 518,015.00 473,167.40 522,550.00 537,775.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL

2018 4700 Wester

Star 52,000 GVWR  

2018 Freightliner M2-106 

with Cummins Peterbilt 348    

B. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 165-180 days 120 days 150-180 days 120 days    

2 ea. *

19,000 GVWR (minimum) 84" CA, 4x2 regular-cab, cab-chassis with installed reinforced utility UNIT PRICE 85,691.00   87,000.00 92,225.00 92,861.00

body and a 6,000 lb. corner mounted crane complete, per specifications TOTAL 171,382.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 174,000.00 184,450.00 185,722.00

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 2017 Ford F550

 

 Ram 5500

Ford F550 4x2 Regular

cab F5G 2017 Ford F550 F5G

C. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 150-180 days   90-120 days 180 days 150-180 days

Net Net Net Net Net Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

 

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 

Ancira Motor Co. Demandstar

Doggett Freightliner of South TX SAWS Website

Freightliner of SA

Grande Ford

Grande Truck Center

Kenworth French Ellison Truck Center

Rockdale Country Ford 

Rush Truck Center

Santex Truck Center

Silsbee Ford
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